SEPTEMBER 24, 1982, TAX AUCTION

PARCEL #

005-142-06
005-400-06
005-680-14
006-380-22
006-503-05
006-580-34
006-740-01-18
006-770-01-18
016-420-28
022-290-13
022-290-15
023-260-05
023-360-21
023-460-07
023-460-08
024-320-04
026-150-57
026-150-66
026-180-13
026-180-41
026-200-33
026-330-12
026-380-08
028-020-36
028-113-15
029-270-04
029-450-17
032-231-10
035-110-12
041-430-02
042-330-14
043-230-14
045-540-46
046-210-36
052-050-29
056-350-30
056-350-31
056-350-32
056-370-16
064-350-01
065-117-02

MINIMUM BID

7,000.00
4,000.00
225.00
450.00
5,000.00
100.00
1,250.00
29,375.00
650.00
9,250.00
9,250.00
50.00
8,000.00
1,000.00
1,000.00
13,500.00
5,200.00
16,000.00
7,000.00
5,000.00
2,700.00
10,400.00
1,750.00
50.00
50.00
3,650.00
2,450.00
100.00
400.00
2,400.00
6,000.00
100.00
7,500.00
6,250.00
100.00
18,500.00
11,000.00
43,000.00
13,000.00
200.00
250.00

SALE PRICE

225.00

100.00

1,000.00

1,000.00
1,000.00

7,750.00

250.00
2,400.00

950.00

300.00

1,000.00
300.00

OTHER

REDEEMED
NO BID

SOLD
REDEEMED
NO BID

SOLD
REDEEMED
REDEEMED
SOLD
REDEEMED
REDEEMED
WITHDRAWN
REDEEMED
SOLD

SOLD

NO BID
REDEEMED
NO BID

SOLD
REDEEMED
REDEEMED
WITHDRAWN
NO BID
WITHDRAWN
WITHDRAWN
WITHDRAWN
NO BID

SOLD
REDEEMED
SOLD

NO BID

SOLD

NO BID

NO BID

SOLD
REDEEMED
REDEEMED
NO BID
REDEEMED
SOLD

SOLD



065-670-01
066-640-10
067-380-54
068-320-13
070-290-29
074-060-12
074-190-09
075-190-37
077-260-08
079-050-30
081-190-39
081-300-09
081-480-03
081-160-19
084-010-38
088-090-09
088-380-02
097-010-31
097-030-26
098-380-02
099-190-29
104-442-09
105-470-01
108-270-06
109-050-03
109-160-52
201-042-07
205-330-09
205-350-05-12
205-550-15-12
206-110-06
207-380-05-12
304-120-11
305-130-07
305-140-11
305-310-20
701-010-16
701-040-04
701-070-20
701-070-21
701-070-22
701-070-23
702-290-21
703-240-05
704-150-11

100.00
30,000.00
150.00
17,500.00
27,000.00
5,000.00
11,250.00
11,000.00
8,250.00
12,500.00
250.00
26,000.00
20,000.00
600.00
12,350.00
50.00
50.00
14,000.00
69,000.00
16,500.00
8,250.00
6,000.00
60,000.00
7,500.00
500.00
240,000.00
300.00
800.00
31,920.00
42,000.00
250.00
17,700.00
6,250.00
12,750.00
9,250.00
14,500.00
25,000.00
8,000.00
7,000.00
7,000.00
5,000.00
6,500.00
500.00
2,500.00
12,500.00

250.00

300.00

5,000.00

8,250.00

350.00

6,000.00

500.00

400.00

SOLD

REDEEMED

SOLD

NO BID
REDEEMED

SOLD

REDEEMED
REDEEMED

SOLD

NO BID

SOLD

REDEEMED
REDEEMED

NOT AUTHORIZED
REDEEMED
WITHDRAWN
WITHDRAWN
REDEEMED
WITHDRAWN
WITHDRAWN
REDEEMED

SOLD

REDEEMED

NO BID

SOLD

(-12,-13) REDEEMED
NOT AUTHORIZED
REDEEMED

NOT AUTHORIZED
NOT AUTHORIZED
SOLD

REDEEMED
REDEEMED
REDEEMED

NO BID
REDEEMED
REDEEMED
REDEEMED
REDEEMED
REDEEMED
REDEEMED
REDEEMED
REDEEMED
REDEEMED
REDEEMED



