Results of the February 26, 2010, Public Tax Auction

Offered: 32 Redeemed: 19 Deeds Filed: March 3, 2010
Sold: 6 Withdrawn: 3
Total Sales: $110,600.00 No Bid: 4 Claim Deadline: “March 3, 2011
Gross
Item Assessment Minimum Sale Excess
No. Number Last Assessee Bid Price Proceeds
1 006-120-002-000 BARNES OLIVER R & VIOLET B 13,600.00 NO BID
2 017-570-016-000 ROWDEN WILLIAM H REDEEMED
3 017-570-017-000 ROWDEN KATHY ETAL REDEEMED
4 017-570-018-000 ROWDEN KATHY ETAL REDEEMED
5 027-230-001-000 OAK RUN LUMBER CO LLC REDEEMED
6 030-070-012-000 ATAIDE JASON & CROUCH FAMILY REDEEMED
7 035-210-021-000 GJB MANAGEMENT CO 1,600.00 2,000.00 273.95
8 035-210-022-000 GJB MANAGEMENT CO 9,200.00 40,000.00 30,717.58
9 042-330-019-000 WEBB ADAM J & CARIE | ETAL REDEEMED
10 045-540-042-000 VOGELER EDWARD J JR LIVING TRUST REDEEMED
11 046-210-034-000 MEJIA BERTHA 2,600.00 2,600.00 -39.50
12 046-410-030-000 SHARP VICKI A ETAL WITHDRAWN
13 049-110-004-000 ABLE CAPITAL COMPANY REDEEMED
14 059-360-019-000 TRI COUNTIES BANK 170,000.00 NO BID
15 065-160-002-000 BACA EULALIO & MARY WITHDRAWN
16 088-470-032-000 EVANS JOHN & GARCIA JANET REDEEMED
17 095-100-019-000 PASTEGA KENNETH G & LYNETTE S JT 36,500.00 45,000.00 8,431.84
18 097-010-062-000 EDWARDS ED F REDEEMED
19 097-010-068-000 EDWARDS ED F REDEEMED
20 097-110-026-000 EDWARDS ED F REDEEMED
21 201-530-028-000 KOSNIKOWSKI RAYMOND M TR REDEEMED
22 202-180-020-000 MONTAGUE MICHAEL JAMES ETAL 4,700.00 10,000.00 5,261.53
23 203-240-005-000 SMITH CAROL D REDEEMED
24 205-250-012-000 WINDLE JERRY L & MARY JT REDEEMED
25 206-270-022-000 STRICKLAND JAMES W & BARBARA JR REDEEMED
26 206-310-017-000 CRAWFORD DOUGLAS D & HEIDI JT WITHDRAWN
27 304-040-005-000 GJB MANAGEMENT CO 7,200.00 11,000.00 3,857.21
28 304-070-013-000 SILVER DANA RICHARD 3,100.00 NO BID
29 304-070-014-000 AMES DONALD B 7,100.00 NO BID
30 305-210-010-000 CHAMBERS RANDALL F & CINDY L REDEEMED
31 702-320-009-000 FINANCIAL FITNESS LLC TR REDEEMED
32 704-120-011-000 STEVENSON DONALD & NANCY REDEEMED
TOTAL SALES: 110,600.00
TOTAL GROSS EXCESS PROCEEDS: 48,502.61




